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Rules and Non-Rule Projects Applicable to TGPC (1/10/24 - 4/23/24) 

Project Number and 
Reason for Project 

Title, Description, and Project Manager 
Agenda for 

Proposal 
Agenda 

Adoption 

2024-006-230-OW 

State/Legislation 

Groundwater Certification Requirements: Currently, 
municipalities and counties may require certification 
during the plat application and approval process that 
adequate groundwater is available for a proposed 
subdivision if groundwater under the land is the 
source of water supply. Senate Bill 2440, 88th Texas 
Legislature, Regular Session, 2023 amended Local 
Government Code (LGC), Section (§) 212.0101 and 
§232.0032 to require groundwater certification during 
the platting process with limited exceptions (outlined 
in the statute). 

Project Manager: Abiy Berehe 

5/10/24   

2023-139-321-OW 

State/Legislation 

Land Application of Dairy Waste and Disposal of 
Dairy Waste in Control Facility: Amendment of 30 
TAC Chapter 321, Control of Certain Activities by Rule, 
Subchapter B, Concentrated Animal Feeding 
Operations, to amend Section 321.32 and add new 
Sections 321.48 and 321.49 to allow for land 
application and disposal of dairy waste. 

Projection Manager: Joy Alabi 

  

2024-009-285-CE 

State/Legislation/Staff/ 
Petition 

Proposed Changes to 30 TAC Chapter 285, OSSFs: 
Amendment of 30 TAC 285 to improve clarity and 
consistency, modernize requirements to reflect the 
current practices and capabilities of the OSSF industry, 
and to implement HB 4087 of the 88th Legislature, 
Regular Session, 2023.  

6/26/24 12/4/24 

2023-099-230-OW 

Straight quad review 

Rule Review of Chapter 230: As required by the Texas 
Government Code, 2001.039, staff is conducting a 
review of 30 TAC 230, Groundwater Availability 
Certifications for Platting, to determine if the need for 
the rules within this chapter continue to exist. The 
comment period was closed on October 9, 2023, and 
no comments were received 

9/8/23 3/6/24 

2023-042-222-OW 

Straight quad review 

Rule Review of Chapter 222: As required by the Texas 
Government Code, §2001.039, staff is conducting a 
review of 30 TAC Chapter 222, Subsurface Area Drip 
Dispersal Systems, to determine if the need for the 
rules within this chapter continue to exist. 

11/24/23 6/26/24 

 

https://www6.tceq.texas.gov/rules/index.cfm?fuseaction=external_reports.projectDetail&projectID=2158
https://www6.tceq.texas.gov/rules/index.cfm?fuseaction=external_reports.projectDetail&projectID=2152
https://www.tceq.texas.gov/permitting/ossf/staff-initiated-rulemaking-project
https://www6.tceq.texas.gov/rules/index.cfm?fuseaction=external_reports.projectDetail&projectID=2112
https://www6.tceq.texas.gov/rules/index.cfm?fuseaction=external_reports.projectDetail&projectID=2055

